
Recently	
  in	
  the	
  early	
  morning	
  hours	
  the	
  words	
  of	
  a	
  poem	
  began	
  to	
  form	
  in	
  
my	
  heart	
  as	
  I	
  thought	
  of	
  the	
  Lord's	
  return.	
  	
  The	
  result	
  is	
  posted	
  below,	
  and	
  I	
  
trust	
  you	
  will	
  recognize	
  the	
  scriptures	
  being	
  referenced	
  and	
  are	
  listed	
  below	
  
the	
  poem.	
  

	
  

I’m	
  preparing	
  a	
  special	
  place	
  for	
  you	
  

It	
  is	
  in	
  My	
  Father’s	
  house.	
  

I’ll	
  come	
  and	
  take	
  you	
  home	
  when	
  He	
  says,	
  

“It’s	
  time”	
  with	
  His	
  thunderous	
  shout.	
  

	
  

First	
  the	
  faithful	
  who	
  have	
  died	
  will	
  rise;	
  

Then	
  the	
  living	
  will	
  join	
  in.	
  

You’ll	
  receive	
  a	
  brand	
  new	
  body	
  

That	
  will	
  have	
  no	
  taint	
  of	
  sin.	
  

	
  

Israel	
  will	
  one	
  day	
  call	
  for	
  Me	
  

In	
  deep	
  sorrow	
  for	
  her	
  shame	
  

For	
  rejecting	
  the	
  very	
  Son	
  of	
  God	
  

Who	
  for	
  her	
  salvation	
  came.	
  

	
  

You’ll	
  go	
  with	
  Me	
  in	
  great	
  glory	
  

When	
  in	
  victory	
  I	
  come	
  as	
  King.	
  

Those	
  who	
  live	
  on	
  earth	
  in	
  My	
  kingdom	
  

Will	
  enjoy	
  the	
  peace	
  that	
  I	
  bring.	
  

	
  

Then	
  all	
  sin	
  will	
  be	
  judged	
  and	
  the	
  earth	
  made	
  anew,	
  	
  

Truth	
  and	
  goodness	
  will	
  ever	
  abide.	
  

You’ll	
  never	
  imagine	
  what	
  I	
  have	
  prepared	
  

For	
  My	
  own,	
  My	
  precious	
  bride.	
  

	
  

John 14:1–3 “Let not your heart be troubled: ye believe in God, believe also in me. 
In my Father’s house are many mansions: if it were not so, I would have told you. 



I go to prepare a place for you. And if I go and prepare a place for you, I will come 
again, and receive you unto myself; that where I am, there ye may be also.” 

1 Thessalonians 4:16–17 “For the Lord himself shall descend from heaven with a 
shout, with the voice of the archangel, and with the trump of God: and the dead in 
Christ shall rise first: Then we which are alive and remain shall be caught up 
together with them in the clouds, to meet the Lord in the air: and so shall we ever 
be with the Lord.” 

1 Corinthians 15:53 “For this corruptible must put on incorruption, and this 
mortal must put on immortality.” 

Matthew 23:39 “For I say unto you, Ye shall not see me henceforth, till ye shall 
say, Blessed is he that cometh in the name of the Lord.” 

Zechariah 13:9 “And I will bring the third part through the fire, and will refine 
them as silver is refined, and will try them as gold is tried: they shall call on my 
name, and I will hear them: I will say, It is my people: and they shall say, The 
LORD is my God.” 

Zechariah 12:10 “And I will pour upon the house of David, and upon the 
inhabitants of Jerusalem, the spirit of grace and of supplications: and they shall 
look upon me whom they have pierced, and they shall mourn for him, as one 
mourneth for his only son, and shall be in bitterness for him, as one that is in 
bitterness for his firstborn.” 

Revelation 19:11–14 “And I saw heaven opened, and behold a white horse; and he 
that sat upon him was called Faithful and True, and in righteousness he doth 
judge and make war. His eyes were as a flame of fire, and on his head were many 
crowns; and he had a name written, that no man knew, but he himself. And he 
was clothed with a vesture dipped in blood: and his name is called The Word of 
God. And the armies which were in heaven followed him upon white horses, 
clothed in fine linen, white and clean.” 

Isaiah 9:6–7 “For unto us a child is born, unto us a son is given: and the 
government shall be upon his shoulder: and his name shall be called Wonderful, 
Counsellor, The mighty God, The everlasting Father, The Prince of Peace. Of the 
increase of his government and peace there shall be no end, upon the throne of 
David, and upon his kingdom, to order it, and to establish it with judgment and 
with justice from henceforth even for ever. The zeal of the LORD of hosts will 
perform this.” 

Revelation 20:11–15 “And I saw a great white throne, and him that sat on it, 
from whose face the earth and the heaven fled away; and there was found no place 
for them. And I saw the dead, small and great, stand before God; and the books 
were opened: and another book was opened, which is the book of life: and the dead 
were judged out of those things which were written in the books, according to 
their works. And the sea gave up the dead which were in it; and death and hell 
delivered up the dead which were in them: and they were judged every man 
according to their works. And death and hell were cast into the lake of fire. This is 
the second death. And whosoever was not found written in the book of life was 
cast into the lake of fire.” 

Revelation 21:1–4 “And I saw a new heaven and a new earth: for the first heaven 
and the first earth were passed away; and there was no more sea. And I John saw 
the holy city, new Jerusalem, coming down from God out of heaven, prepared as a 



bride adorned for her husband. And I heard a great voice out of heaven saying, 
Behold, the tabernacle of God is with men, and he will dwell with them, and they 
shall be his people, and God himself shall be with them, and be their God. And 
God shall wipe away all tears from their eyes; and there shall be no more death, 
neither sorrow, nor crying, neither shall there be any more pain: for the former 
things are passed away.” 

1 Corinthians 2:9 “But as it is written, Eye hath not seen, nor ear heard, neither 
have entered into the heart of man, the things which God hath prepared for them 
that love him.” 

Ephesians 5:25–32 “Husbands, love your wives, even as Christ also loved the 
church, and gave himself for it; That he might sanctify and cleanse it with the 
washing of water by the word, That he might present it to himself a glorious 
church, not having spot, or wrinkle, or any such thing; but that it should be holy 
and without blemish. So ought men to love their wives as their own bodies. He 
that loveth his wife loveth himself. For no man ever yet hated his own flesh; but 
nourisheth and cherisheth it, even as the Lord the church: For we are members of 
his body, of his flesh, and of his bones. For this cause shall a man leave his father 
and mother, and shall be joined unto his wife, and they two shall be one flesh. This 
is a great mystery: but I speak concerning Christ and the church.”	
  


